
 
GET YOUR KICKS ON ROUTE 66 

EXCERPTS FROM THE GRAPES OF WRATH 

Highway 66 is the main migrant road. 66 - the long concrete path across the country, waving 
gently up and down on the map, from Mississippi to Bakersfield - over the red lands and the 
grey lands, twisting up into the mountains, crossing the Divide and down into the bright and 
terrible desert, and across the desert to the mountains again, and into the rich California 
valleys.  

66 is the path of a people in flight, refugees from dust and shrinking land, from the thunder of 
tractors and shrinking ownership, from the desert's slow northward invasion, from the twisting 
winds that howl up out of Texas, from the floods that bring no richness to the land and steal 
what little richness is there. From all of these the people are in flight, and they come into 66 
from the tributary side roads, from the wagon tracks and the rutted country roads. 66 is the 
mother road, the road of flight...  

The cars of the migrant people crawled out of the side roads onto the great cross country 
highway, and they took the migrant way to the West. In the daylight, they scuttled like bugs to 
the westward; and as the dark caught them, they clustered like bugs near to shelter and to 
water. And because they were lonely and perplexed, because they had all come from a place of 
sadness and worry and defeat, and because they were all going to a new mysterious place, they 
huddled together; they talked together; they shared their lives, their food, and the things they 
hoped for in the new country. Thus it might be that one family camped near a spring, and 
another camped for the spring and for company, and a third because two families had 
pioneered the place and found it good… 

Thus they changed their social life—changed as in the whole universe only man can change. 
They were not farm men any more, but migrant men. And the thought, the planning, the long 
staring silence that had gone out to the fields, went now to the roads, to the distance, to the 
West. That man whose mind had been bound with acres lived with narrow concrete miles. And 
his thought and his worry were not any more with rainfall, with wind and dust, with the thrust 
of the crops. Eyes watched the tires, ears listened to the clattering motors, and minds struggled 
with oil, with gasoline, with the thinning rubber between air and road. Then a broken gear was 
tragedy. Then water in the evening was the yearning, and food over the fire. Then health to go 
on was the need and strength to go on, and spirit to go on. The wills thrust westward ahead of 
them, and fears that had once apprehended drought or flood now lingered with anything that 
might stop the westward crawling. 

Source: Steinbeck, J. (1939). The Grapes of Wrath. Viking Penguin. Reprinted with permission of Viking Penguin, a division of 
Penguin Putnam, Inc. 
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